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Alerts

1 event
25 results matching for 'Applications for Amendment' during May 2009.

Number Title Date
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2002240703 Method and system for secure information 20 May 2009

2002256092 Controlled delivery of tetracycline compounds and tetracycline derivatives 20 May 2009

2002342045 Beta-lactamyl vasopressin Vlaantagonists 20 May 2009

2002361681 Motorcycle handlebar with shock absorber 20 May 2009

2003221549 Method and dietary composition for improving lipid digestibility 20 May 2009

2003229021 Storing and querying relational data in compressed storage format 20 May 2009

2003252846 An Electric Fence Energiser with Overload Protection 20 May 2009

2003259751 Devices and methods for detecting amniotic fluid in vaginal secretions 20 May 2009

2003262724 Method and system for communicating content on a broadcast services communication
system

20 May 2009

2003296059 Method of measuring the molecular weight of phosphoric acid monoester compound and
additive for mass spectrum measurement

20 May 2009

2003297086 Double cross parallel binder fabric 20 May 2009

2003297286 Seam assist attachment device 20 May 2009

2004214491 Retail quality function deployment 20 May 2009

2004256669 Electrolyte composition, and photoelectric converter and dye-sensitized solar cell using
same

20 May 2009

2004261252 Pyridazine derivatives and their use as therapeutic agents 20 May 2009

2004285609 Anion-binding polymers and uses thereof 20 May 2009

2004291534 Self-regulating gas generator and method 20 May 2009

2004310584 Dye-sensitized solar cell 20 May 2009

2005220459 Retroreflection sheet and outer illumination type illumination system 20 May 2009

2005259894 Pyrrolotriazine kinase inhibitors 20 May 2009

2006201898 Transdermal electrotransport delivery device including an antimicrobial compatible
reservoir composition

20 May 2009

2006246452 Cyclone dust collecting apparatus for vacuum cleaner 20 May 2009

2006338201 All-optical logic gates using nonlinear elements 20 May 2009

2007101214 Door operator with door position sensor 20 May 2009

2008202308 Sandwich Press and Grill 20 May 2009
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Terms and Conditions
General

The information provided in this report is not in the nature of legal or other professional advice.

The information provided in this report is derived from third parties and may contain errors. You must
make your own enquiries and seek independent advice from the relevant industry professionals
regarding any information in this report.

Patents, patent applications, trademarks and trademark applications shown as lapsed or ceased may be
restored at a later date.

Disclaimer of warranty and limitation of liability

Neither IPMonitor, its affiliates nor any of their respective employees, agents, third party content
providers or licensors warrant that the information contained in this report is error free; nor do they
make any warranty as to the accuracy, reliability or content of any information in this report.

This report is provided on an "as is" basis; to the maximum extent permitted by law, IPMonitor
disclaims all representations and warranties, express or implied, with respect to any information
conatined in this report. In addition, IPMonitor does not represent or warrant that the information
contained in this report is accurate, complete or current.

This disclaimer of liability applies to any damages or injury caused by any failure of performance,
error, omission, interruption, deletion, defect, delay in operation or transmission, computer virus,
communication line failure, theft or destruction or unauthorized access to, alteration of, or use of
record, whether for breach of contract, tortious behavior, negligence, or under any other cause of
action.

Copyright

The content of this report may be protected by copyright laws and treaties around the world and all
rights relating to the same are reserved. Any paper or digital copies of this report are not to be
modified or any illustrations or any graphics used separately from any accompanying text.

Arbitration

Any dispute or difference whatsoever arising out of or in connection with this report shall be
submitted to arbitration in accordance with, and subject to, The Institute of Arbitrators & Mediators
Australia Rules for the Conduct of Commercial Arbitrations.

IPMonitor reserves the right to update the Terms and Conditions at any time without notice. Please
see the full Terms and Conditions at www.IPMonitor.com.au/trademarks/info/terms
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